Olin Chlor Alkali Products &

Alexander Chemical Corp., A

Vinyls Carus Company
ESTIMATED
BID ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION
QUANTITY
i H hlorit 000to 5

1 Sodium Hypochlorite, 3,000 to 5,000 100,000 Gallon 077|$ 77,000.00 | $ 0.8276|$  82,760.00
gallons per delivery
Sodi H hlorite, 20 to 700 gall

2 odium Hypochiorite, 20 to /EL gatlons 25,000 Gallon NoBid |$ s 1.16[$  29,000.00
per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

3 3.0-4.0 ph, 55,000 Gallon No Bid S -1 1.56|$ 85,800.00
3,000 to 5,000 gallons per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

4 3.0-4.0 ph, 1,500 Gallon No Bid S -1 459(s 6,885.00
20 to 200 gallons per delivery
Alumi Sulfate, Liquid, 2,000 gal . .

5 u'mlnum uitate, tqut gal per 12,000 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S -
delivery
Bead Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

6 1333, Product #6086, 55 lbs. per bag, 16,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
1,980 Ibs. per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

7 1334, Product #2560, 450 |bs. per drum, 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
3 to 4 drums per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc (R) C-

8 9530. 450 Ibs. per drum, 2 drums per 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
delivery

9 Liquid Polymer, Praestol # K274FLX, 5,200 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -

9a 40 lbs. per pail, 8 to 16 pails per delivery

9b 450 Ibs. per drum, 1 drum per delivery
Phosphate, Liquid 15 gall il, 8 . .

10 osphate, Hquld 2> gatlons per pal 3,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
pails per delivery
Molasses, semi-liquid

11 el 100 Tons NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
6 tons per delivery
Calcium Nitrate .

12 48,000 Gallon No Bid S - 1S 2.60(S 124,800.00
2000 gallons per delivery
TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEMS #1 -12 $ 77,000.00 $ 329,245.00




Viking Chemical Polydyne Inc.
ESTIMATED
BID ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION
QUANTITY
i H hlorit 000to 5

1 Sodium Hypochlorite, 3,000 to 5,000 100,000 Gallon NoBid |3 - NoBid |3 -
gallons per delivery
Sodi H hlorite, 20 to 700 gall

2 odium Hypochiorite, 25 to 750 gations 25,000 Gallon 1.88|$  47,000.00 NoBid |$ -
per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

3 3.0—-4.0 ph, 55,000 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S -
3,000 to 5,000 gallons per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

4 3.0-4.0 ph, 1,500 Gallon 249(S 3,735.00 No Bid S -
20 to 200 gallons per delivery
Alumi Sulfate, Liquid, 2,000 gal .

5 urmindm Suftate, Haul galper 12,000 Gallon 1.59|$  19,080.00 NoBid |3 -
delivery
Bead Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

6 1333, Product #606, 55 Ibs. per bag, 16,000 Pound No Bid S - 1.81|S 28,960.00
1,980 Ibs. per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

7 1334, Product #2560, 450 |bs. per drum, 10,000 Pound No Bid S - 1.11|S 11,100.00
3 to 4 drums per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc (R) C-

8 9530. 450 Ibs. per drum, 2 drums per 10,000 Pound No Bid S - 1.06|S 10,600.00
delivery

9 Liquid Polymer, Praestol # K274FLX, 5,200 Pound No Bid S - 11118 5,772.00

9a 40 lbs. per pail, 8 to 16 pails per delivery

9b 450 Ibs. per drum, 1 drum per delivery
Phosphate, Liquid 15 gall il, 8 .

10 osphate, HQuid 2> gallons per pal 3,000 Gallon 9.32|$  27,960.00 NoBid |$ -
pails per delivery
Molasses, semi-liquid

11 oy 100 Tons NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
6 tons per delivery
Calcium Nitrate .

12 48,000 Gallon 2.29(S$ 109,920.00 No Bid S -
2000 gallons per delivery
TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEMS #1 -12 $ 207,695.00 $ 56,432.00




PVS Chemical Solutions Univar
ESTIMATED
BID ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION
QUANTITY
i H hlorit 000to 5

1 Sodium Hypochlorite, 3,000 to 5,000 100,000 Gallon NoBid |3 - NoBid |3
gallons per delivery
Sodi H hlorite, 20 to 700 gall

2 odium Hypochiorite, 20 to /EL gatlons 25,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$
per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

3 3.0-4.0 ph, 55,000 Gallon 1.32|S 72,600.00 No Bid S
3,000 to 5,000 gallons per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

4 3.0—-4.0 ph, 1,500 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S
20 to 200 gallons per delivery
Alumi Sulfate, Liquid, 2,000 gal . .

5 u'mlnum uitate, tqut gal per 12,000 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S
delivery
Bead Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

6 1333, Product #6086, 55 lbs. per bag, 16,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S
1,980 Ibs. per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

7 1334, Product #2560, 450 |bs. per drum, 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S
3 to 4 drums per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc (R) C-

8 9530. 450 Ibs. per drum, 2 drums per 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S
delivery

9 Liquid Polymer, Praestol # K274FLX, 5,200 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S

9a 40 lbs. per pail, 8 to 16 pails per delivery

9b 450 Ibs. per drum, 1 drum per delivery
Phosphate, Liquid 15 gall il, 8 . .

10 osphate, Hquld 2> gatlons per pal 3,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$
pails per delivery
Molasses, semi-liquid

11 el 100 Tons NoBid |$ - NoBid |$
6 tons per delivery
Calcium Nitrate

12 mm 48,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$
2000 gallons per delivery
TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEMS #1 -12 $ 72,600.00 S




USALCO Chemtrade
ESTIMATED
BID ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION UNIT PRICE |EXTENSION
QUANTITY
i H hlorit 000to 5

1 Sodium Hypochlorite, 3,000 to 5,000 100,000 Gallon NoBid |3 - NoBid |$ -
gallons per delivery
Sodi H hlorite, 20 to 700 gall

2 RIS FYPOCHIQTILS, 2510 A8V 8aT0NS 25,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

3 3.0—-4.0 ph, 55,000 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S -
3,000 to 5,000 gallons per delivery
Sodium Bisulfite, minimum 38% solution,

4 3.0—-4.0 ph, 1,500 Gallon No Bid S - No Bid S -
20 to 200 gallons per delivery
Alumi Sulfate, Liquid, 2,000 gal

5 de‘:ir::;’m dirate, Hadl galper 12,000 Gallon 0.9977|$  11,972.40 2.0250|$  24,300.00
Bead Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

6 1333, Product #6086, 55 lbs. per bag, 16,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
1,980 Ibs. per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc CE-

7 1334, Product #2560, 450 |bs. per drum, 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
3 to 4 drums per delivery
Liquid Polymer, Polydyne Clarifloc (R) C-

8 9530. 450 Ibs. per drum, 2 drums per 10,000 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -
delivery

9 Liquid Polymer, Praestol # K274FLX, 5,200 Pound No Bid S - No Bid S -

9a 40 lbs. per pail, 8 to 16 pails per delivery

9b 450 Ibs. per drum, 1 drum per delivery
Phosphate, Liquid 15 gall il, 8 . .

10 osphate, tquid 2> gations per pal 3,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
pails per delivery
Molasses, semi-liquid

11 el 100 Tons NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
6 tons per delivery
Calcium Nitrate

12 mm 48,000 Gallon NoBid |$ - NoBid |$ -
2000 gallons per delivery
TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR ITEMS #1 -12 $ 11,972.40 $  24,300.00




